
MIKKELI-JUKOLA 2025 PRE GAMES WRE
MIDDLE DISTANCE 24.8.2024

- 23.8.2024

https://navisuunnistus.fi/mikkeli-jukola-2025-pre-games-24-25-8-2024/

COMPETITION INSTRUCTIONS

The competition will be held according to the SSL rules of the sport and the 
competition rules of the organisers.The final rules will be available at the start of the 
competition. The final competition rules are available at the competition centre.  

SUMMARY

Competition venue:  Hasantie 51, 50670 Mikkeli Google Maps: 
https://maps.app.goo.gl/P7nMbzC1e88jgQka8 

Directions: from Hirvensalmentie 431. Google Maps: 
https://maps.app.goo.gl/P7nMbzC1e88jgQka8 

Start times on Saturday from 12 noon and Sunday (for the national relay) from 10 am, 
times available on the competition website.

Distance to the start on Saturday 0,5.

Race numbers near the information desk, emit backup patches at the starting points.

MAP AND TERRAIN

Map 6/2024 mapped by Jussi Silvennoinen. Scale for middle distance for H/D10-45 
1:10 000 and for H/D50-80 1:7 500. Map size for saturday A4, for children A5 and for 
sunday relay A3.

Control descriptions are available both loose (with their own mounting hardware) for 
M21E and W21E and on the maps.

Competitors may keep their own map after their performance. In accordance with the 
rules of the sport and in the spirit of fair play, competitors are not allowed to show the 
race map and course to competitors who have not yet started and coaches/guardians 
are not allowed to pass on information to competitors who have not yet started.

Prohibited areas are marked on the race map. Some of the edges of the forbidden 
areas are marked on the course with a ribbon. There are also forbidden areas in the 
terrain which are not marked on the map due to their small size. These areas are 
marked on the terrain with a ribbon.

https://maps.app.goo.gl/P7nMbzC1e88jgQka8
https://maps.app.goo.gl/P7nMbzC1e88jgQka8


PUNCHING SYSTEM

Emit punching will be used for the race. For competitors whose Emit number was not 
indicated in their registration via Irma or Eventor, the organisers have reserved a 
rental Emit which can be claimed at the information desk (price 5e/day/each). Any 
changes to the Emit number must be made at the info desk before departure, change 
fee 5e/each.

RACE NUMBERS

Number patches available near the info for M21E and W21E. Bring your own safety 
pins! 

COURSE LENGTHS

Shown on the competition web page: 

https://navisuunnistus.fi/mikkeli-jukola-2025-pre-games-24-25-8-2024/

For M21E there will be two sets: M21E1, M21E2 (According to WRE-ranking)

START

Classes: WRE

Departure waiting area: Emit backup patches available.  

4 minutes before the start: competitors will be called by name to the start stall. Loose 
control descriptions available.

3 minutes before the start: Emit reset.

2 minutes before start: race map available.

1 minute before the start: Competitors wait for the last minute at the map bucket and 
can take the map at the start. Please make sure that you take the map from the 
bucket of your series.

RESULTS

Online results and final results will be available at the web page.

FINISH

There will be a marked route from the last control to the finish. Punch at the finish line 
in and proceed to unload your emit card. All competitors, including drop-outs, should 
attend to emit checkout as soon as possible after their performance.

https://navisuunnistus.fi/mikkeli-jukola-2025-pre-games-24-25-8-2024/


PRIZES

Top three finishers will be awarded.

DRINKING

There will be no drink stations in the terrain. 

COMPETITION CENTRE SERVICES

Cafeteria, toilet. The cafeteria offers sandwiches, pastries, coffee and sausages. No 
separate restaurant.  

No washing facilities, and changing is done in terrain conditions.  

There is also Suunnistajan kauppa in the competition centre.

Moderately warm weather is forecast for the weekend. Please remember to stock up 
on drinks before and after your run.

FIRST AID

There will be a first aid station at the race centre. The staff at the drinking places and 
starting points can contact first aid if necessary.

OFFICIALS

Race directior Juho Siikilä, juho.siikila@gmail.com, +35850 3765 224

Course setter Olli-Markus Taivainen

Info Milka Viita, milkaviita@gmail.com 

First aid Teemu Partio

Results Aki Tenhunen, Timo Harju

Race supervisor Tapani Koskela WRE  (Ville Kauppi relay)

Jury: Mikko Niskanen KyS, Anna Närhi LS-37, Santeri Silvennoinen 
KR

Warmly welcome to Mikkeli!

- Navi


